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Introduction 
Indigenous knowledge is local knowledge that social capital 

of the poor people, exploring and demonstrating their life. It is 
unique, traditional, local knowledge that exists within and is de-
veloped around the specific conditions of people indigenous to a 
particular geographic area in a particular period [1]. Indigenous 
knowledge is the consequence of practical knowledge and it con-
tinually influenced by internal creativity and experimentation. It 
is found to be socially attractive, economically profitable, sustain-
ability and involves minimum risk to rural farmers and producers. 
Besides, indigenous knowledge systems provide a frame for refer-
ence in strengthening agricultural extension programmes. There-
fore identifying, documenting and incorporating indigenous tech-
nical knowledge in agriculture is essential to achieve sustainable 
agricultural development. 

Knowledge management

Knowledge management is managing the knowledge and it is 
focuses on the creation, preservation, sharing and utilization of 
knowledge in the corporate environment is gaining popularity in 
the management of indigenous and external knowledge in the in-
digenous organizations of developing countries [2]. 

In the knowledge management, knowledge is accumulating, 
storing and sharing to people and organizational effectiveness. Ef-
fective knowledge management is ensures that knowledge is creat-
ed, stored and used to meet the goals and needs of the people and 

their organizations. The effective implementation of knowledge 
management practices in organizations depends on the selection 
and deployment of the relevant tools, approaches and practices [3].

Adam’s knowledge management model 

Figure 1: ADAM’s Model.

The indigenous knowledge management behaviour of people 
has been analysed consist of the Adam’s model of knowledge man-
agement. According to the Adam’s model, the knowledge manage-
ment behaviour of people described as follows.
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Acquisition Development Access Management

Gaining the 
information on  
traditional 
wisdom. 
People were 
gaining the 
information 
from their  
parents, 
grandparents,  
neighbour-
hoods, 
relations and 
friends.

The stage of 
knowledge  

development 
concerns with 
identifying and 
generating a set 

of knowledge 
documents from 
information that 

has been acquired 
from acquisition 
stage. They were 
gained through  
experience and 

trial & error  
method. People 
learned through 

repetition,  
repetition aids is 
the retention and 
reinforcement of 

indigenous  
knowledge.

In this stage, 
knowledge 

is stored and 
accessed via 
information 

retrieval 
systems.

Knowledge 
access is 

providing 
accurate 

knowledge 
to general 

public.

It mainly deals 
with knowledge 

codification 
which results 
in making the 

indigenous  
traditional 
knowledge  

visible, accessible 
and usable for 

decision  
making by  

various groups of 
end users.

Table 1

Conclusion 
Indigenous knowledge management is mechanism of culture, 

knowledge of local people and local resource management. It is 
important to preserve people knowledge for sustainable develop-
ment nation. Gathering information regarding indigenous technical 
knowledge has to be offered prime importance in extension studies 
so as to explore local innovation of tribal farming community as 
well as protect them by legal tools like IPR with benefit of sharing 
and avoiding bio piracy.
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